| 5. | Please indicate the monthly rate to be charged to each single-family residential customer for waste pickup. | | | | | |
|----|--|----------------|--|-----------------------------------|--|--|
| | ONE COLLECTION/WEEK | | | | | |
| | PRICE FOR CURBSIDE: | | | § 18.00 per unit | | |
| | PRICE FOR BACK OF HO | USE: | | <u>\$ 24.00 per unit</u> | | |
| 6. | Please indicate the weekly and monthly rate to be charged to each single-family residential customer for waste pickup to include large items (such as refrigerators, water heaters, mattresses, televisions, and similar items). | | | | | |
| | CURB PRICE EACH WEEK | : | \$One (1) Large/E per resident at r | Bulky item per week, no charge | | |
| | CURB PRICE ONCE A MON | NTH: | \$ <u>One (1) Large/B</u> per resident at r | Bulky item per week, no charge | | |
| 7 | Please indicate the monthly rate to be charged to each single-family residential customer for recycling pickup. Please differentiate between the once-a-week collection and every other week collection. | | | | | |
| | <u>WEEK</u> | NE COLLE | ECTION/WEEK | EVERY OTHER | | |
| | PRICE FOR CURBSIDE: | \$ <u>8.00</u> | <u>)</u> | <u>\$5.25</u> | | |
| 8. | Please indicate the monthly rate to be charged to each single-family residential customer for yard waste pickup (including Christmas Trees). | | | | | |
| | | | ONE COLLECTION | ON/WEEK | | |
| | PRICE FOR CURBSII | E: | <u>\$6.00</u> | | | |
| | | | | | | |

| 9. Please indicate the monthly rate to be charged to each multifamily residential | | | | | |
|---|---|---|--|--|--|
| customer for was | | g | | | |
| | | ONE COLLECTION/WEEK* | | | |
| PRICE FOR IN | DIVIDUAL BINS: | \$ NO BID \$ 17.75 | | | |
| PRICE FOR SHARED BINS: | | § NO BID | | | |
| PRICE FOR DU | MPSTERS: | §80.14 per container | | | |
| * Rumpke will prov units that will req | * Rumpke will provide 2 cubic yard containers on casters for all multifamily units that will require container service. | | | | |
| *** For item 9, whic | *** For item 9, which type of bin/dumpster will be provided to each customer? | | | | |
| 10. Indicate the monthly rate to be charged to each multifamily residential customer for recycling pickup. PRICE PER MONTH FOR CURBSIDE: \$8.00 per unit - weekly service 5.25 per unit - every other week 11. Please indicate the monthly rate to be charged to multifamily residential customer for yard waste pick up. | | | | | |
| | | ONE COLLECTION/WEEK | | | |
| PRICE FOR IND | DIVIDUAL BINS: | §6.00 per unit | | | |
| PRICE FOR SHARED BINS: PRICE FOR DUMPSTERS: | | \$One (1) container \$6.00, additional carts \$5.00 each \$NO BID | | | |
| ease indicate the rate to be charged if all services, recycling, yard waste, and waste are cked up on: | | | | | |
| icked up on: | to be charged if all serv | vices, recycling, yard waste, and waste are | | | |
| NE DAY | to be charged if all serves See attached Property | | | | |

12. Please provide your monthly charges for the following services:
(1.) ONE EIGHT YARD DUMPSTER WITH LOCKING CAPABILITY OR EQUIVALENT AT CITY HALL.

ONE COLLECTION/WEEK

<u>\$154.93</u>

- 13. Commercial service: please indicate the monthly service charge for commercial (business) service:
 - A. WEEKLY PICKUP OF FOUR 33-GALLON GARBAGE CONTAINERS OR UP TO SEVEN PLASTIC BAGS.

ONE COLLECTION/WEEK TWO /WEEK

\$18.00 per unit curbside \$24.00 per unit rear door \$36.00

B. DUMPSTER SERVICE: PLEASE INDICATE THE MONTHLY SERVICE CHARGE FOR DUMPSTER SERVICE:

COLLECTIONS PER WEEK

| CONTAINER SIZE | ONCE | TWICE |
|----------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|
| 1 YARD | § NO BID | §NO BID |
| 2 YARD | § 80.14 per container | § 162.05 per container |
| 3 YARD | § NO BID | § NO BID |
| 4 YARD | § 103.29 per container | §206.57 per container |
| 5 YARD | \$ NO BID | \$_NO BID |
| 6 YARD | \$ 126.44 per container | \$_254.65 per container |
| 8 Yard | \$ 154.93 per container | \$ 308.08 per container |
| City of Audubon Park | Rumpke | A |

0037m + ***

8

| | See attached Proposal Summary |
|-----|---|
| | |
| | |
| 15 | Please state any additional service, not in conflict with the provisions above, we you will provide at no additional charge to the city (i.e., back of house trash piet for elderly or infirm if notified by resident): |
| | See attached Proposal Summary |
| | |
| | |
| | |
| 16. | Please describe what procedures are employed in the event of adverse wea conditions: See attached Proposal Summary |
| | |
| | |
| | · · |
| 17. | Describe what procedures are taken by the bidder when screening employees p to employment, and what monitoring if any occurs during employment: See attached Proposal Summary |
| | |

Rumple

| 10 | Thease describe the customer service procedures that are employed by the bidder for the city and individual customers (include provisions for local contact for service inquiries, special services, or equipment, miss collections etcetera). See attached Proposal Summary |
|-----|---|
| 19. | Normal contract horizon is limited to 1 fiscal year. Please indicate your interest in an extended agreement, subject to available city appropriations, with the same price structure proposed above. See attached Proposal Summary |
| | eee attached i roposal Cuminary |
| | ** Alternative proposals may be submitted on separate pages in similar format. ** |

10

Under Items 8 through 10, Rumpke will provide the required frontload and/or rearload containers for solid waste, yardwaste and recycling collection based on the individual needs of each multifamily complex.

PROPOSED COLLECTION DAYS

Rumpke proposes to provide residential and multifamily solid waste, yardwaste and curbside recycling collection as follows:

Rear Door Weekly Trash Collection :

Friday

• Curbside Automated Trash Collection:

Thursday

Curbside Weekly Yardwaste:

Friday

Curbside Weekly/EOW Recycling:

Friday

Commercial solid waste collection will be provided on Tuesdays and Fridays, or as otherwise mutually agreed upon between the City, commercial customer and Rumpke.

HOLIDAYS

Holidays observed by Rumpke include New Year's Day, Memorial Day, The Fourth of July, Labor Day, Thanksgiving Day, and Christmas Day. If the holiday is the day-of or a weekday before your service day: Service will be delayed one day that week. If the holiday is on a weekday after your service day or on Saturday or Sunday, service will occur as scheduled.

ADDITIONAL SERVICES OFFERED:

Rumpke offers the following services which are in addition to the regular collection, and which would involve extra charges to the customer:

95-Gallon Trash Carts:

\$3.50 Each Per Month

95-Gallon Recycling Carts:

\$3.50 Each Per Month

95-Gallon Yardwaste Carts:

\$3.50 Each Per Month

Cart charges would be invoiced directly to participating residents on a quarterly and in advance basis. All carts shall remain the property of Rumpke.

PROCEDURES IN THE EVENT OF ADVERSE WEATHER CONDITIONS:

In the event of incapacitating weather making scheduled collection unsafe, Rumpke will collect the trash the following workday or as soon as roads are cleared and safe for operation. The City and residents will be informed of the makeup schedule via radio, newspaper, or local cable station.

PROCEDURES FOR SCREENING EMPLOYEES

EMPLOYEE SCREENING, RECRUITING, TRAINING, AND DEVELOPMENT
Operating safely and maintaining regulatory compliance are key.

Operating safely and maintaining regulatory compliance are key components to Rumpke's business. Rumpke works to meet or exceed all local, state, regional and federal standards pertaining to the industry. Several of Rumpke's corporate departments – Safety Department and Engineering and Environmental Affairs Department – lead Rumpke's efforts to ensure compliance. Managers, supervisors, and line employees are trained to manage daily safety and environmental procedures.

Day-to-day operations are monitored by full-time qualified safety professionals at all Rumpke districts. Rumpke facilities follow strict guidelines to protect the safety and health of employees and the public. With more than 30 full-time safety managers company-wide, Rumpke has one of the highest safety personnel per capita in the waste









CITY OF AUDUBON PARK, KENTUCKY PROPOSAL SUMMARY

DISPOSAL PLAN:

All solid waste collected will be transported to the Louisville Transfer Station for final disposal at Rumpke's Medora Sanitary Landfill (permit attached). Yardwaste will be collected and delivered to the Smith Creek Compost Facility in Louisville, where it will be composted and recyclables will be transported to Rumpke's Material Recovery Facility in Louisville, Kentucky for processing and shipment to market.

COLLECTION EQUIPMENT

Rumpke will assign the following equipment to provide services under this contract based on the service option selected by the City:

- One (1) Mack or Autocar CNG cab over chassis rear load truck with McNeilus 25-cubic yard packer body for solid waste collection;
- One (1) Mack or Autocar CNG cab over chassis automated rear load truck with McNeilus 25-cubic yard packer body for solid waste collection;
- One (1) Mack or Autocar CNG cab over chassis rear load truck with McNeilus 25-cubic yard packer body for yardwaste collection;
- One (1) Mack or Autocar CNG cab over chassis rear load truck with McNeilus 25-cubic yard packer body recycling with side load truck with side load claw for curbside recycling.

Based on collection services selected by the City automated equipment is proposed for solid waste, yardwaste or curbside recycling collection service within the City of Audubon Park.

Rear door service will require two (2) employees will be assigned to each truck for solid waste collection and one (1) employee per truck for yardwaste and curbside recycling collection.

More than 80 trucks operate out of Rumpke's Louisville facility, any of which would be available as support for backup. Attached please find a complete listing of equipment operated out of Rumpke's Louisville facility. In addition, Rumpke's large fleet of over 2,600 trucks companywide assures the City of sufficient equipment to perform the services required under this contract. Rumpke is currently in the process of adding Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) trucks to our fleet and these new trucks could be assigned to provide the services provided during the term of this contract.

Rumpke's Louisville office employs 110 full-time employees, of which four (4) employees are assigned strictly to cover employee absences.

Should automated equipment be utilized, Rumpke routinely conducts safety meetings to reenforce training to spot safety concerns such as; low wires, low branches, light posts, parked cars, etc.

CARTS FOR SOLID WASTE, YARDWASTE AND RECYCLING

Under Items 5 through 7, Rumpke will provide a 95-gallon recycling cart to each residence to hold their commingled recyclables at no additional charge. Residents will be responsible to provide their own containers/bags for solid waste and yardwaste collection. Should the city choose automated collection, each residence would be provided with (1) 95-gallon trash cart at no charge. Additional trash carts would be invoiced directly to participating residents on a quarterly and in advance basis.





